
APPROACHESTOTHESTUDYOFCOMPARATIVEPOLITICS

LegalMethod

Sinceweareexploringthetraditionalapproaches,wewillalsorefer tomethods
like legal and juridical. As evident, this means that we shall analyse political
systems along with the institutions and legal processes that comprise it. For
politicalscientistsusingthis
method, law and justiceare not limited tobeing the mattersof jurisprudence but
thestate
itself is treated as in charge of an equitable and effective system of law and
order.
Therefore, for political scientists, organizational matters, as well as those
relatedto
jurisdiction and independence of judicial institutions, are matters of concern.
Statehas
been analysed as a corporation or a juridical person by analytical jurists from
Ciceroin
ancient times to Dicey in the modern period. Politicsthus became a science of
legal
norms, independent of the science of the state as a social organism. This
approach,
therefore,treatsstateastheprimeentity tocraftandimplementlaws.
Applied to the study of national and international politics, the legal method
presumes
that any actionwhichisto betakenincaseofanemergency isprescribed in law.
It
forbids action taking in some other situations, thus fixing the limit of action
permitted.
Moreover, it emphasizes that where rule of law prevails, its very knowledge
amongthe
citizens can help in determining their political behaviour. However, by its very
nature,the
legalmethodisverynarrow.
PhilosophicalMethod



Principles of political theory were laid with the help of history, law, ethics and
philosophy.
This approach significantly contributed to literature on normative political
theory. Thinkers
like Plato and Burke successfully laid down the principlesof political theory and
developed
concepts like liberty and equality, rights, law and justice. On the one hand, with
traditional
approach, Plato, Kant and Hegel idealized the state; onthe other hand, Aristotle,
Hobbes
and Machiavelli became more practical and developed theories of the state
whichcould
be practiced for real. Relationship between politics and law was adopted by
Grotius,
Bentham, Austin and Dicey. This approach continued to remain in operation for
avery
long time and examined every political institution with the help of available
evidences.
ComparativeApproach

The comparative method, its nature and scope, has its own supporters and
critics. Theorists
like A. N. Eisenstadt argue that the approach has no specific method but
involvesfocuses
on cross-societal institutional or other macro aspects of societies for social
analysis.On
theother hand,theoristslikeArendLijphart,contendthat comparativeapproach
isa
method and not just a vague term that symbolizes or indicates towards the
focusofone’ s
research. Lijphart defines this method as a basic method compared to others
that are
more experimental, statistics-based or rely on case studies to make
generalizations.



Another theorist,HaroldLasswell,arguesthatthecomparativenaturewithinthe
scientific
approach cannot be avoided and thus to anyone who uses such an approach to
apolitical
phenomena,a completely independent comparativemethod, seemsredundant.
Comparative approach has also been equated to the scientific method by
Gabriel
Almond. Yet, there is a general agreement between different scholars that the
comparative
method is not a method of measurement but aimed at discovering empirical
relationships
betweenvariables. The first step isto measure variablesbefore a relationship is
explored
among them. It isthelatter step whichisreferred toasthecomparative method.
Theorists
argue that a distinction must be made between the technique and the method
andidentify
comparative method asa broad, general method and not a narrow, specialized
technique.
Keeping these arguments in mind, theorists refer to it as the comparative
approach
method or a method of comparisonbecause it lacksthenature and principlesof
amethod.
Therefore, the comparative approach can also be thought of as a more basic
research
strategythana strategictoolofresearch.
Whencomparedwiththeexperimental,statisticalorcasestudymethods, the
comparative approach can be better understood. For instance, the
experimentalmethod
is a process to understand the relationship between two variables in a
controlled
environment. Such experiments are rare and difficult in political science,
therefore,an



alternative is used by the way of statistical method. Within statistical method,
theempirical
data is conceptually manipulated to discover controlled relationships among
variables.
Control is ensured through division of the sample into many different groups,
alsoreferred
toaspartingcorrelationsorcrosstabulations, likedifferentiatingonthebasisof
age,
income, gender, education. This is followed by finding the correlation between
twoselected
variables in each case. This is the standard procedure followed in this method
and
applied to most empirical research. The two methods— experimental and
statistical—
usethesamelogicandareoftenreferredtoastheapproximationofeachother.


